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National Foreword

I.S.  EN  6059-407:2019 is the adopted Irish version of the European Document EN  6059-407:2019,
Aerospace  series  -  Electrical  cables,  installation  -  Protection  sleeves  -  Test  methods  -  Part  407: 
Mark  adherence  and  print  permanence

This document does not purport to include all the necessary provisions of a contract. Users are responsible
for its correct application.

For relationships with other publications refer to the NSAI web store.

Compliance  with this  document does  not of  itse lf  confer immunity  from legal obligations .       

In line with international standards practice the decimal point is shown as a comma (,) throughout this
document. 
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European foreword 

This document (EN 6059-407:2019) has been prepared by the Aerospace and Defence Industries 
Association of Europe - Standardization (ASD-STAN). 

After enquiries and votes carried out in accordance with the rules of this Association, this Standard has 
received the approval of the National Associations and the Official Services of the member countries of 
ASD, prior to its presentation to CEN. 

This European Standard shall be given the status of a national standard, either by publication of an 
identical text or by endorsement, at the latest by December 2019,  and conflicting national standards shall 
be withdrawn at the latest by December 2019. 

Attention is drawn to the possibility that some of the elements of this document may be the subject of 
patent rights. CEN shall not be held responsible for identifying any or all such patent rights. 

According to the CEN Internal Regulations, the national standards organizations of the following 
countries are bound to implement this European Standard: Austria, Belgium, Bulgaria, Croatia, Cyprus, 
Czech Republic, Denmark, Estonia, Finland, France, Germany, Greece, Hungary, Iceland, Ireland, Italy, 
Latvia, Lithuania, Luxembourg, Malta, Netherlands, Norway, Poland, Portugal, Republic of North 
Macedonia, Romania, Serbia, Slovakia, Slovenia, Spain, Sweden, Switzerland and the United Kingdom. 
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1 Scope 

This document specifies the method and means for testing the mark adherence and print permanence 
characteristics of sleeves used to identify electrical cable and cable bundles for aerospace applications. 

This test method evaluates the performance of printed samples produced by a specific supplier 
recommended print system. The print system will include: product, printer, printer ribbon and printer 
settings as applicable. 

2 Normative references 

There are no normative references in this document. 

3 Terms and definitions 

No terms and definitions are listed in this document. 

• IEC Electropedia: available at http://www.electropedia.org/ 

• ISO Online browsing platform: available at http://www.iso.org/obp 

4 Preparation of samples 

The tube size for testing is 6 mm to 7 mm as supplied internal diameter; (however, this method can also 
be used for other tube sizes as required – the mark performance shall be as specified in the relevant 
product standard for the tested product size). 

The samples shall be printed as specified by the supplier using the recommended ribbon and printer 
system. 

For thermal transfer and Dot Matrix print systems use one line of text printed in the middle of the test 
sample using 10 pt Arial – bold font to achieve a minimum contrast of C8 as shown in Annex A. 

For laser marked samples use Roman S 3,8 mm. 

If testing samples in the recovered state the products shall undergo full unrestricted recovery at the times 
and temperatures specified in the product standard. 

Unrecovered samples shall be tested flat. 

All samples shall be tested in the unsupported state unless otherwise specified in the product standard. 

5 Apparatus 

The apparatus shall be designed such that the rubbing member (eraser or cloth) can be securely attached 
to a moving arm that can be loaded with a specified weight. 

The weighted arm with the rubbing member shall move as shown in Figure 1. 

The speed of rub shall be approximately 1 (one) cycle every 2 (two) seconds. 

The rubbing member shall be adjusted so that the rubbing face is parallel to the test piece. 

I.S. EN 6059-407:2019
This is a free page sample. Access the full version online.

http://www.electropedia.org/
http://www.iso.org/obp


This is a free preview.  Purchase the entire publication at the link below:

Product Page

Looking for additional Standards? Visit Intertek Inform Infostore 

Learn about LexConnect, All Jurisdictions, Standards referenced in Australian legislation

https://shop.standards.ie/en-ie/standards/i-s-en-6059-407-2019-1158156_saig_nsai_nsai_2751264/
https://www.intertekinform.com
https://www.intertekinform.com/en-au/regulatory-management/lexconnect-and-codeconnect/

